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The Royal Cornwall Hospitals NHS Trust Response to Information request
Date Request Received: 14 June 2024 FOI Ref No: 25050
Requested Information/Response

Please respond to this request under the FOI Act.

1) How many of your fixed term consultants are not on the specialist register
(for fixed term consultants hired in year 2023)

10 — we cannot identify which consultants are fixed term or locums as they are
categorised the same on our employment records.

2) How many of your locum consultants are not on the specialist register (for
locum consultants hired in year 2023)

10 — see above - this represents the combined number of both fixed term and locum
consultants.

3) For the fixed term consultants hired in 2023 who are not on the specialist
register, and do not hold CCT or CESR, please provide the level of training
grade for each doctor. We are not requesting personalized data, only
statistical non-personal data as follows:

Fixed term consultant 1 = level of training grade (for example CT1-3 or ST1-ST6 etc)
Fixed term consultant 2= level of training grade

This information is not available from our employment records as they will be
registered at current consultant grade not their previous training grade.

4) For the locum consultants hired in 2023 who are not on the specialist
register,and do not hold CCT or CESR, please provide the level of training
grade for each doctor. We are not requesting personalized data, only
statistical non-personal data as follows:

Locum consultant 1 = level of training grade (for example CT1-3 or ST1-ST6 etc)
Locum consultant 2= level of training grade

This information is not available from our employment records as they will be
registered at consultant grade not their previous training grade.
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