
 

 
FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000 
 
THE ROYAL CORNWALL HOSPITALS NHS TRUST RESPONSE TO INFORMATION REQUEST 
 
Date Request Received: 10 February 2015 FOI Ref: 709 
 
Requested Information 
All the questions in the Freedom of Information request below relate to the period 01 April 2013 – 31 
January 2015. 
 
1) What is the average length of time for an older person (+65), once considered medically fit, to 

be discharged into a: 
 

a) Nursing Home; 
b) Community Hospital; 
c) Residential Home; 
d) Home (with a package of care);  or 
e) Home or family member (without any package of care) 

 
If the information above is not available, can you advise by: 

 
f) Simple – Self-care; 
g) Simple – Return (to care home); 
h) Simple – Restart +/-; 
i) Simple – Reablement (including new POC, STEPS and Community Hospital referrals); or 
j) Complex (incl Fast Track) 

 
2) How much does this average discharge time cost the Trust?  The costs queried relate to the total 

cost of the wait of the above delay from decision to discharge, then that figure broken down 
on an average of per person. 

 
3) What is the average cost per night of stay (as an inpatient medically fit waiting for discharge), 

for an elderly person at:  Royal Cornwall Hospital, Truro (RCH), West Cornwall Hospital, Penzance 
(WCH), and St Michael’s Hospital, Hayle (SMH)? 

 
4) What is the average number of operations cancelled due to the above delays in discharge? 
 
5) What is the average cost of a cancelled operation at RCH, WCH, and SMH? 
 
6) What is the average cost associated with delays in cancelled operations, (eg lost potential 

income) due to delayed discharges of an older person at RCHT, WCH and SMH? 
 
7) What is the average cost of a bed per night, per person at each of the 3 hospitals (RCH, WCH, 

and SMH)? 
 
8) What is the total number of A&E re-admissions to the Trust of older persons who were discharged 

from hospital with the same complaint they came in with previously?    
 

a) What is the average time-lapse between re-admissions? 
 
9) How many Care Home residents (older persons), including Nursing, Residential and EMI were 

admitted on an emergency basis in the last 2 years?   
 
10) What number of beds were occupied on average, by an older person for unplanned 

admissions at RCH, WCH and SMH?   
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11) What was the average number of beds occupied by an older person for planned operations?   
 
12) Has the Trust calculated the cost of timely discharges of the elderly verses delayed discharges? 
 
13) Has the Trust identified the causes of the delays in discharges of older persons, in any internal 

reviews or audits etc?  
 

a) Has it formulated a strategy in response to the causes of delay? 
 
14) Is the Trust compensated by Social Services if a delay in discharge of an older person is caused 

by Adult Social Care, Peninsula Community Health or similar partner organisations? 
 
15) What is the total number of older person discharges from the Discharge Lounge at RCH?  
 

a) Based on the categories in Question 1 (either ‘a-e’ or ‘f-g’), what were their destinations?  
 
16) How many older persons have died whilst waiting to be discharged?  

 
a) How many of those who died were a delayed discharge? 

 
If you do not hold the information for the dates shown, we could perhaps discuss alternative time 
sets so the compiled information is comparable. 
 
Response 
Please be advised that the Royal Cornwall Hospitals NHS Trust (RCHT) do not record delayed transfer 
of care information for every individual.  Although the overall length of stay for a person is known 
within the Patient Administration System (PAS), this does not currently differentiate whether they are 
a patient who requires on-going in-patient treatment, or whether they are experiencing a delayed 
discharge.  We do conduct a monthly ‘Delayed Transfer of Care’ report (on the last Thursday of 
every month); however, this report only captures a snapshot of the number of patients experiencing 
delays. 
 
1) Unfortunately we are unable to provide a response to this question as this information is not 

recorded and therefore not held.  In the Monthly Delayed Transfer of Care report, we do not 
record the age of the patient, neither do we capture the discharge destination.  There is a 
question in the report which relates to days lost for people waiting for a care home; however, 
the figure reported is for all days lost in the month and we are unable to calculate per person, 
the number of days lost.  As the report only provides a ‘snapshot’ of data, we are unable to 
report on the average for the whole Trust. 

 
2) It is not possible to answer this question.  As advised in the response to Question 1), the average 

discharge time for a patient is not recorded.  Neither can we calculate the average cost from 
the snapshot of data as every patient’s needs are individual and therefore their care 
requirements differ greatly and the associated costs.  We would have to identify (where 
possible) and scrutinize every patient’s medical records (captured in the snapshot of data) to 
try and calculate the costs relating to any delay in discharge and I have estimated that it would 
exceed the appropriate limit1 to do so. 

 
 
 
 
 

 

1 The appropriate limit is specified in regulations and for RCHT this is set at £450.  This represents the 
estimated cost of 1 person spending 2½ working days in determining whether RCHT hold the 
information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information. Consequently RCHT is not obliged 
under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to respond to this part of your request. 
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3) The RCHT do not record if a patient is medically fit and awaiting discharge; therefore this 
information is not held.  Detailed below is the average bed day cost (for a ward stay) across the 
3 sites regardless of age or medical fitness: 
 

Royal Cornwall Hospital, 
Truro 

St Michael’s Hospital,  
Hayle 

West Cornwall Hospital, 
Penzance 

£183 £252 £179 
 

4) The RCHT do not record this information; this data is not held.  The number of cancelled 
operations at the Trust has previously been published in response to a previous FOI request (FOI 
Ref 690) which you may find helpful to your enquiry. 

 
5) The average cost of a cancelled operation would be £171. 

 
6) This information is not held (please see response to Question 4). 

 
7) Please see the response to Question 3). 

 
8) This information is not held by the RCHT.  The Emergency Department (ED) use a system called 

‘Oceano’ whereas inpatient data is recorded on ‘PAS’; it is not possible to marry up the 2 
electronic systems to determine this information.  It may be possible to obtain this information 
through a manual trawl, but I have estimated that it would exceed the appropriate limit to do 
so. 

 
a) N/A 

 
9) There were 4,503 emergency admissions from patients over (and including) the age of 65 years 

from care homes2 in the last 2 years (01 February 2013 – 31 January 2015 inclusive). 
 
10) The average number of overnight beds occupied (each day) for patients over the age of 65 

years, for emergency admissions in the period 01 April 2013 – 31 January 2015. 
 
Royal Cornwall Hospital, 

Truro 
St Michael’s Hospital,  

Hayle 
West Cornwall Hospital, 

Penzance 
81 Nil 14 

 
11) The average number of overnight beds occupied (each day) for patients over the age of 65 

years, for elective admissions in the period 01 April 2013 – 31 January 2015. 
 
Royal Cornwall Hospital, 

Truro 
St Michael’s Hospital,  

Hayle 
West Cornwall Hospital, 

Penzance 
281 14 33 

 
12) The Trust can find no recorded information to indicate that these costs have been calculated. 
 
13) Audits conducted by the Trust which include elements relating to discharge and which may be 

relevant to your request are listed below: 
 

 Early Supported Discharge Pilot (May 2014); and  
 Review of the National Dementia Audit Cases, Concentrating on Discharge (August 2013) 

2 Please be advised that we are cannot guarantee the accuracy of this information.  Our systems 
do not record if a patient has been admitted from a care home (including nursing and residential).  
With local knowledge however, we have been able to search by postcode of known care homes 
in Cornwall, or if the address on the systems has ‘care’ and/or ‘home’ in the title.  Therefore the 
data provided may include patient(s) who also share that post code.  Without accessing individual 
patient records, there is no other way to determine this information. 
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a) The Trust has identified ‘discharge’ as a priority 2 audit; however, at the present time there is 

no recorded plan for this. 
 

14) No; however, please be advised that we are currently dealing with a separate request for 
information relating specifically to the Community Care (Delayed Discharges Act) of 2003 and 
you may find this response useful.  The response to this request will be published on our web 
page through the Disclosure Log by the end of March under reference FOI Ref 723. 
 

15) Please be advised that the ‘discharge lounge’ is no longer open.  The information provided in 
the table below has been sourced from PAS – number of elderly patients discharged.  Due to 
the way that information is recorded, where a patient’s ‘usual place of residence’ is a 
care/nursing/residential home, then this will be reported under ‘usual place of residence’ and 
not separately.  We have matched the postcodes of those addresses in this category that are 
known care/nursing/residential homes in Cornwall, and there were a total of 5,407 cases. 

 
Destination on Discharge No. of Discharges to Location 
Local Authority Residential Home 38 
NHS Hosp other prov - Gen 4,634 
NHS Hosp other prov - Mat 9 
NHS Hosp other prov - MI 69 
NHS Nursing Home 142 
Other Hosp within prov 2,795 
Other non-NHS Hospital 147 
Other provider unit within Hosp 180 
Penal Establishment 2 
Private Nursing Home 491 
Private Residential Home 237 
Special Hospital eg Broadmoor 14 
Temporary residence 816 
Usual place of residence 107,828 
Voluntary Nursing Home 5 
Voluntary Residential Home 15 
Hospice 4 
Grand Total 117,426 

 
16) As the information in Question 1) is not collated, we are unable to answer this question; the 

information is not held. 
 
a) N/A 

 
Attachment(s)? 
None 
 
Date Response Sent: 
09 March 215 
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